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Death: Our Hope is in Jesus Christ 
 
Those who have died in Christ 
And I heard a voice from heaven saying unto me, Write, Blessed [are] the dead which die in the Lord from henceforth Yea, 
saith the Spirit, that they may rest from their labours; and their works do follow them. Revelation 14:13 
 
Resurrection 
Martha said to Him, "I know that he will rise again in the resurrection on the last day."  John Jesus said to her, "I am the 
resurrection and the life; he who believes in Me will live even if he dies, and everyone who lives and believes in Me will 
never die. Do you believe this?" John 11:24-26 
 
Brothers, we do not want you to be ignorant about those who fall asleep, or to grieve like the rest of men, who have no 
hope. We believe that Jesus died and rose again and so we believe that God will bring with Jesus those who have fallen 
asleep in him. 1 Thessalonians 4:13-14 
 
Hope 
For God has not destined us for wrath, but for obtaining salvation through our Lord Jesus Christ, who died for us, so that 
whether we are awake or asleep, we will live together with Him.  Since the children have flesh and blood, he too shared in 
their humanity so that by his death he might destroy him who holds the power of death—that is, the devil—and free those 
who all their lives were held in slavery by their fear of death. 1 Thess 5:9-10 
 
So will it be with the resurrection of the dead. The body that is sown is perishable; it is raised imperishable; it is sown in 
dishonor, it is raised in glory; it is sown in weakness, it is raised in power; it is sown a natural body, it is raised a spiritual 
body. If there is a natural body, there is also a spiritual body. 1 Corinthians 15:42-44  
 
But when this perishable has put on the imperishable, and this mortal will have put on immortality, then will come about the 
saying that is written, "DEATH IS SWALLOWED UP in the victory. "O DEATH, WHERE IS YOUR VICTORY? O  DEATH, 
WHERE IS YOUR STING?" 1 Cor 15:54-55 
 
Now we know that if the earthly tent we live in is destroyed, we have a building from God, an eternal house in heaven, not 
built by human hands. Meanwhile, we groan, longing to be clothed with our heavenly dwelling. 2 Corinthians 5:1-2  
 
God’s View 
Precious in the sight of the LORD Is the death of His godly ones. Ps 116:15 
 
We are confident, I say, and would prefer to be away from the body (dead) and at home with the Lord.  2 Corinthians 5:8  
"He will wipe every tear from their eyes. There will be no more death or mourning or crying or pain, for the old order of 
things has passed away" (Revelation 21:4).  
The righteous perish, and no one ponders it in his heart; devout men are taken away, and no one understands that the 
righteous are taken away to be spared from evil. Those who walk uprightly enter into peace; they find rest as they lie in 
death. 
Isaiah 57:1-2 
 
For our light and momentary troubles are achieving for us an eternal glory that far outweighs them all. So we fix our eyes 
not on what is seen, but on what is unseen. For what is seen is temporary, but what is unseen is eternal.  2 Corinthians 
4:17-18  
 
Rejoice in Christ 
(After the death and mourning of his son)…David arose from the ground, washed, anointed {himself,} and changed his 
clothes; and he came into the house of the LORD and worshiped. 2 Sam 12:20 


